



Attorneys At Law

# HARRISON SALE McCLOY

RECEIVED  
OCT 12  
BY:

304 Magnolia Avenue  
Post Office Drawer 1579  
Panama City, Florida 32401

T 850.769.3434 F 850.769.6121

PENSACOLA COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY  
POST OFFICE BOX 12910  
PENSACOLA FL 32521

ACCOUNT NO: 111768-000  
STATEMENT NO: 7

PAGE: 1  
October 07, 2011

ATTENTION: BECKY BRAY

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

		HOURS
09/08/2011	DJS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND REVIEW THREE INTERLOCALS. EMAIL TO BECKY BRAY.	2.75
09/12/2011	DJS INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT.	0.50
09/14/2011	DJS WORK ON INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT.	1.50
	DJS WORK ON INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT.	2.00
	DJS FINISH INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT DRAFT.	1.00
09/15/2011	DJS TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BECKY BRAY. RECEIVE AND REVIEW CITY ATTORNEY'S CHANGES. TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BECKY BRAY. EMAIL TO BECKY BRAY.	1.50
09/20/2011	DJS EMAIL FROM CLIENT. TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT RE: CITY RE-ORGANIZATION AND CRA OPTIONS. REVIEW CHARTER.	1.25
09/22/2011	DJS TWO TELEPHONE CALLS FROM BECK BRAY RE: PROSPECT AND RESALES CONTRACT. PULL FILE.	0.40
09/28/2011	DJS EMAIL FROM BECKY BRAY. RECEIVE AND REVIEW NOTICE. EMAIL TO BECKY BRAY.	0.60
	DJS EMAIL FROM BECKY BRAY X 2.	0.25
09/29/2011	DJS RECEIVE AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM CHAIR.	0.15
09/30/2011	DJS TELEPHONE CALL FROM BECKY BRAY AND ASSISTANT CITY ATTORNEY RE: NOTICES.	0.75

PENSACOLA COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY

PAGE: 2  
October 07, 2011

ACCOUNT NO: 111768-000  
STATEMENT NO: 7

GENERAL LEGAL SERVICES

	HOURS	
DJS EMAIL FROM, PREPARE FOR AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAIRWOMAN.	1.00	
FOR CURRENT LEGAL SERVICES	13.65	3,412.50
WEST LAW SEPT. 2011		24.31
WEST LAW SEPT. 2011		17.38
TOTAL EXPENSES THROUGH 09/30/2011		41.69
PREVIOUS BALANCE		\$5,307.00
SUBTOTAL		3,454.19
Total Payments for 09/19/2011		-3,702.50
Total Payments for 10/05/2011		-1,604.50
TOTAL PAYMENTS		-5,307.00
BALANCE DUE		<u>\$3,454.19</u>

DUE UPON RECEIPT. PLEASE INCLUDE THE ACCOUNT NUMBER WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

111768.000

Usage period: 08/01/2011 - 08/31/2011

**Law Firm**

HARRISON SALE MCCLOY & THOMPSON  
304 MAGNOLIA AVENUE  
PANAMA CITY, FL 32401

**Client ID:PCOLA CRA**

***Westlaw Research Charges through 08/31/2011***

		<u>Client Charge</u>
8/25/2011	Westlaw Legal Research	13.78 USD
8/25/2011	Westlaw Legal Research	2.53 USD
8/25/2011	Westlaw Legal Research	6.79 USD
8/25/2011	Westlaw Legal Research	1.20 USD
Total Client Charge		<u>24.31 USD</u>

**Client ID:PENSACOLA CRA**

***Westlaw Research Charges through 08/31/2011***

		<u>Client Charge</u>
8/29/2011	Westlaw Legal Research	0.43 USD
8/29/2011	Westlaw Legal Research	2.31 USD
8/29/2011	Westlaw Legal Research	14.64 USD
Total Client Charge		<u>17.38 USD</u>