



**BEGGS & LANE** RLLP  
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELLORS AT LAW  
SINCE 1883

September 6, 2016

IN ACCOUNT WITH

City of Pensacola  
The Honorable Ashton Hayward  
Mayor of Pensacola  
P. O. Box 12910  
Pensacola, FL 32521-0044

P. O. Box 12950  
Pensacola, FL 32591-2950

Telephone (850) 432-2451  
Fax (850) 469-3331

Matter ID: 2532-71207  
Statement # 79743

Stmt as of September 6, 2016

Re: Bayview Cross Litigation - Kondrat'yev v. The City of Pensacola -

To services as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
6/23/2016	JND	Review complaint and scheduling order; [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Ashton Hayward on 6/21; conference with [REDACTED]	2.50	737.50
6/24/2016	JND	Letter to Ashton Hayward, Brian Cooper, Lysia Bowling, et al; memo to Cindy Hinote	0.20	59.00
6/28/2016	JND	Review complaint; review research re [REDACTED]; review City file; meeting with Mayor regarding [REDACTED]	2.50	737.50
7/1/2016	TLD	Office conference with J. Nixon Daniel, III regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	147.50
7/1/2016	TLD	Review complaint and draft answer.	3.10	914.50
7/2/2016	TLD	Research issue of [REDACTED]	4.90	1,445.50
7/3/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED]	4.50	1,327.50

Fed. ID# 59-0524265

784197-2

V #002112

Fees/Exp Bayview Cross

004000.9335.119082

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 2

7/4/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED]; draft motion to dismiss or for summary judgment.	5.10	1,504.50
7/5/2016	TLD	Research and draft motion to dismiss or for summary judgment.	9.80	2,891.00
7/6/2016	TLD	Research and draft motion to dismiss or for summary judgment.	6.80	2,006.00
7/7/2016	TLD	Research and draft motion to dismiss or motion for summary judgment.	9.90	2,920.50
7/7/2016	JND	Telephone conference with Eric Olson and Mayor Hayward re [REDACTED]; conference with Terrie L. Didier re answer; review and revise draft answer	2.10	619.50
7/8/2016	TLD	[REDACTED] research [REDACTED]	1.20	354.00
7/8/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED]	2.10	619.50
7/8/2016	JND	Meeting with Brian Cooper, Eric Olson and Heidi; review and revise answer	4.10	1,209.50
7/9/2016	TLD	Research and draft affirmative defenses and research for motion for summary judgment.	8.50	2,507.50
7/9/2016	JND	Review and revise answer; research re [REDACTED]	2.60	767.00
7/10/2016	TLD	Revise affirmative defenses.	0.20	59.00
7/11/2016	TLD	Final review and revision of answer and affirmative defenses.	1.10	324.50
7/11/2016	TLD	Review scheduling order.	0.80	236.00
7/12/2016	JKM	Internet research: [REDACTED]	1.00	110.00
7/12/2016	TLD	Draft joint report.	1.70	501.50

Fed. ID# 59-0524265

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 3

7/13/2016	TLD	Review joint report.	0.40	118.00
7/13/2016	TLD	Review documents from City and e-mail to J. Nixon Daniel, III regarding same.	1.10	324.50
7/14/2016	TLD	E-mails from and to opposing counsel regarding Rule 26 conference and joint report.	0.30	88.50
7/15/2016	TLD	[REDACTED]	2.30	678.50
7/18/2016	JKM	Begin review and index Park and Recreation documents related to the Bayview Cross.	2.00	220.00
7/18/2016	TLD	Rule 26 conference call.	0.50	147.50
7/18/2016	TLD	Review plaintiffs' revised joint report and e-mail to J. Nixon Daniel, III regarding same.	0.40	118.00
7/18/2016	TLD	[REDACTED]	0.60	177.00
7/18/2016	JND	Conference with Dick Barker, Lysia Bowling and Eric Olson	0.50	147.50
7/19/2016	TLD	Review proposed changes to joint report.	0.40	118.00
7/20/2016	JKM	Continue to review, organize and index Park & Recreation documents.	3.00	330.00
7/21/2016	JKM	[REDACTED]	0.70	77.00
7/21/2016	JKM	Conference with [REDACTED]	0.20	22.00
7/21/2016	JKM	Telephone call with [REDACTED]	0.20	22.00
7/21/2016	JKM	Conference with [REDACTED]	0.10	11.00

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 4

7/21/2016	TLD	Draft Rule 26 initial disclosures; [REDACTED]	3.00	885.00
7/21/2016	JPD	Conference with [REDACTED] Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.10	29.50
7/21/2016	JPD	Conferences with [REDACTED]	0.20	59.00
7/22/2016	JKM	Continue reviewing parks and recreation board meeting minutes. Telephone call to [REDACTED]	1.70	187.00
7/22/2016	JKM	[REDACTED]	1.30	143.00
7/23/2016	JKM	[REDACTED]	1.00	110.00
7/23/2016	JKM	Telephone call with [REDACTED] Email to J. Nixon Daniel, III and Terrie L. Didier.	0.30	33.00
7/25/2016	TLD	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.40	118.00
7/25/2016	TLD	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.20	59.00
7/26/2016	TLD	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.50	147.50
7/26/2016	TLD	Review [REDACTED]	1.70	501.50
7/27/2016	TLD	Review [REDACTED]; draft motion for summary judgment.	3.80	1,121.00
7/27/2016	TLD	E-mail to [REDACTED]	0.30	88.50
7/27/2016	JND	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	1.00	295.00

Fed. ID# 59-0524265

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 5

7/28/2016	TLD	Amend Rule 26 disclosures.	0.30	88.50
7/28/2016	TLD	[REDACTED]	1.90	560.50
7/29/2016	JKM	Telephone call with [REDACTED]	0.10	11.00
7/29/2016	TLD	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.40	118.00
7/29/2016	TLD	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.40	118.00
7/29/2016	TLD	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.20	59.00
7/29/2016	TLD	E-mails from and to [REDACTED]	0.20	59.00
8/1/2016	TLD	Update Rule 26 disclosures.	0.20	59.00
8/1/2016	TLD	E-mail to [REDACTED]	0.20	59.00
8/2/2016	JKM	Communicate with [REDACTED]	0.30	33.00
8/4/2016	TLD	Conference call with [REDACTED]	1.00	295.00
8/4/2016	TLD	Review cases regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	147.50
8/4/2016	JND	Review file; telephone conference with [REDACTED]	1.30	383.50
8/5/2016	JND	Telephone conference with Ashton Hayward	0.40	118.00
8/6/2016	TLD	Research and draft memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	3.70	1,091.50

Fed. ID# 59-0524265

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 6

8/7/2016	TLD	Research and draft memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	1.10	324.50
8/8/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED] research [REDACTED] telephone conference with [REDACTED]	1.10	324.50
8/8/2016	JND	Telephone conference with Mayor Hayward	0.30	88.50
8/9/2016	TLD	Research and draft memorandum regarding [REDACTED]	1.60	472.00
8/10/2016	TLD	Meeting with Ashton Hayward to discuss [REDACTED]	1.50	442.50
8/10/2016	JND	Review file; conference with Eric Olson and Lysia Bowling; conference with Mayor Hayward and Terrie L. Didier	2.00	590.00
8/18/2016	JKM	Communicate with [REDACTED]	0.30	33.00
8/18/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED]	2.20	649.00
8/19/2016	JKM	Research [REDACTED]	5.00	550.00
8/19/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED]	8.20	2,419.00
8/20/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED]	1.50	442.50
8/21/2016	TLD	Research [REDACTED]	3.60	1,062.00
8/22/2016	TLD	Research and draft motion for summary judgment.	5.90	1,740.50
8/23/2016	JKM	Research [REDACTED]	7.50	825.00
8/23/2016	TLD	Research and draft motion for summary judgment.	4.90	1,445.50

Fed. ID# 59-0524265

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 7

8/25/2016	JKM	Research [REDACTED]	8.00	880.00
9/2/2016	TLD	Review [REDACTED] and draft motion for summary judgment.	1.30	383.50
Total Hours			170.50	44,248.00

Rate Summary

- Jodi K. McArthur	32.70	hours at	110.00/hr	\$	3,597.00
Terrie L. Didier	118.00	hours at	295.00/hr	\$	34,810.00
J. Nixon Daniel, III	19.50	hours at	295.00/hr	\$	5,752.50
John P. Daniel	0.30	hours at	295.00/hr	\$	88.50

Total hours: 170.50      Total Fees \$ 44,248.00

Disbursements

Paid to: Jerry A. Dobbs, Jr. mileage reimbursement for travel to UWF (two days) for research	\$	61.13
Paid to: Ms. Jodi McArthur	\$	65.00
Paid to: Jacob K. Jursinski	\$	24.41

Sub-total Expenses: \$ 150.54

Total Now Due: \$ 44,398.54

EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT REQUEST

Client # 2532 Name Jerry A. Dobbs, Jr. Date 8-26-16  
Matter # 71207 Name \_\_\_\_\_  
Attorney \_\_\_\_\_ Destination UWF

Date(s) Incurred 8/13, 8/19, 8/23, 8/25

	AMOUNT
Transportation (Attach carrier's receipt or show car expense for _____ miles at <del>40¢</del> <u>54</u> cents.)	<u>61.13</u>
Taxi .....	_____
Hotel (attach receipt) .....	_____
Meals .....	_____
Tips .....	_____
Entertainment .....	_____
Telephone .....	_____
Other .....	_____
Other .....	_____
TOTAL	<u>61.13</u>

Remarks Bayview Cross Research

Check needed by: \_\_\_\_\_ Date \_\_\_\_\_ Time \_\_\_\_\_

Reimbursed by check number: \_\_\_\_\_



EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT REQUEST

Client # 2532 Name Jodi McArthur Date Aug 26, 2016  
Matter # 11207 Name \_\_\_\_\_  
Attorney JMD/SLO Destination University of West Florida

Date(s) Incurred 8/13, 8/19, 8/23, 8/25  
(15 miles 1 way)

	AMOUNT
Transportation (Attach carrier's receipt or show car expense for _____ miles at 405 cents.)	<u>6.54</u>
Taxi .....	
Hotel (attach receipt) .....	
Meals .....	
Tips .....	
Entertainment .....	
Telephone .....	
Other .....	
Other .....	
<b>TOTAL</b>	<u>6.54</u>

Remarks Bay View Cross  
Research

Check needed by: \_\_\_\_\_ Date \_\_\_\_\_ Time \_\_\_\_\_  
Reimbursed by check number: \_\_\_\_\_

EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT REQUEST

Date 8/26/60

Client # 2532 Name Jacoby Jursinski

Matter # 71207 Name \_\_\_\_\_

Attorney JND/TLD Destination UWF

Date(s) Incurred 8/23, 8/25

	AMOUNT
Transportation (Attach carrier's receipt or show car expense for <u>45.2</u> miles at <u>54</u> cents.)	\$ <u>24.41</u>
Taxi .....	_____
Hotel (attach receipt) .....	_____
Meals .....	_____
Tips .....	_____
Entertainment .....	_____
Telephone .....	_____
Other .....	_____
Other .....	_____
TOTAL	\$ <u>24.41</u>

Remarks \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

Check needed by: \_\_\_\_\_  
Date Time

Reimbursed by check number: \_\_\_\_\_