



BEGGS & LANE RLLP
ATTORNEYS and COUNSELLORS at LAW
SINCE 1883

January 30, 2017

IN ACCOUNT WITH

City of Pensacola
The Honorable Ashton Hayward
Mayor of Pensacola
P. O. Box 12910
Pensacola, FL 32521-0044

P. O. Box 12950
Pensacola, FL 32591-2950

Telephone (850) 432-2451
Fax (850) 469-3331
Matter ID: 2532-71207
Statement # 81832
Stmt as of January 30, 2017

Re: Bayview Cross Litigation - Kondrat'yev v. The City of Pensacola -

To services as follows:

<u>Date</u>	<u>Attorney</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/10/2016	TLD	Research and draft motion to increase word limit; review memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment	3.10	914.50
10/14/2016	TLD	Draft first request for production and first interrogatories	1.10	324.50
10/28/2016	JND	Review and revise motion for summary judgment and [REDACTED]	2.10	619.50
11/2/2016	TLD	Review and revise motion to increase page limit, memorandum in support of motion for summary judgment [REDACTED]	1.20	354.00
11/8/2016	TLD	Meet with [REDACTED]	0.60	177.00
11/9/2016	TLD	Amend memorandum in support of motion for summary judgment	0.20	59.00
11/10/2016	TLD	Office conference with Mayor and others regarding summary judgment	1.00	295.00
11/10/2016	JND	Review file; meeting with Mayor Hayward, Eric Olson, Brian Cooper and Terrie Didier	1.00	295.00

RPH# 792248-1
V#002112
510005.9335.119082
Bayview Cross - Fees
Bayview Cross - Exp

13,479.50
33.38

Fed. ID# 59-0524265

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 2

11/15/2016	TLD	Telephone conference with Brian Cooper [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	118.00
11/16/2016	JKM	Telephone call with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50	55.00
11/16/2016	JKM	Revise [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.70	187.00
11/27/2016	JND	Review and revise brief	1.50	442.50
11/29/2016	TLD	Review discovery from plaintiffs and draft responses to requests for production and interrogatories; revise [REDACTED]	4.90	1,445.50
11/29/2016	TLD	Review and revise memorandum in support of motion for summary judgment	1.70	501.50
12/1/2016	TLD	Research and revise motion for summary judgment	1.20	354.00
12/2/2016	TLD	Revise motion to increase word limit	0.20	59.00
12/2/2016	TLD	Office conference with Ashton Hayward, Brian Cooper and Lysia Bowling regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.50	442.50
12/2/2016	JND	Review discovery; meeting with Ashton Hayward, Lysia Bowling, Brian Cooper and Terrie Didier	1.50	442.50
12/5/2016	TLD	Review file and [REDACTED]; e-mail to J. Nixon Daniel, III regarding same	0.30	88.50
12/13/2016	TLD	E-mails to and from Brian Cooper regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	59.00
12/16/2016	TLD	E-mails to and from plaintiffs regarding extending discovery deadline; draft joint proposed motion to extend discovery deadline	0.80	236.00
12/27/2016	TLD	E-mail to Brian Cooper regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	29.50
12/29/2016	TLD	Office conference with Vicki Lawley regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.80	531.00

Fed. ID# 59-0524265

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 3

1/13/2017	JND	Conference with Mayor Hayward, Mr. Barker and Ms. Bowling	0.50	147.50
1/20/2017	TLD	Office conference with Vicki Lawley regarding [REDACTED]	1.00	295.00
1/24/2017	TLD	Office conference with Vicki Lawley regarding [REDACTED]	0.80	236.00
1/26/2017	TLD	Draft responses to interrogatories and telephone conferences with Vicki regarding same	6.00	1,770.00
1/26/2017	TLD	Office conference with Vicki Lawley regarding [REDACTED]	1.50	442.50
1/26/2017	JND	Review responses to discovery; conference with Terrie L. Didier	0.50	147.50
1/27/2017	TLD	Review documents and draft responses to discovery	3.40	1,003.00
1/27/2017	TLD	Telephone conference with Vicki Lawley regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	59.00
1/28/2017	TLD	Telephone conference with [REDACTED]; review documents supplied by City	4.00	1,180.00
1/28/2017	JND	Letter to Mayor Hayward	0.20	59.00
1/30/2017	JKM	Prepare Mayor Hayward's Response to 1st Interrogatories	1.00	110.00
Total Hours			47.70	13,479.50

Rate Summary

Jodi K. McArthur	3.20	hours at	110.00/hr	\$	352.00
Terrie L. Didier	37.20	hours at	295.00/hr	\$	10,974.00
J. Nixon Daniel, III	7.30	hours at	295.00/hr	\$	2,153.50
Total hours:	47.70	Total Fees	\$	13,479.50	

Beggs & Lane, RLLP

Re: 2532-71207

Page: 4

Disbursements

Copy cost	\$	15.25
Westlaw search-September 2016	\$	9.57
Westlaw search-December 2016	\$	8.56

Sub-total Expenses: \$ 33.38

Total Now Due: \$ 13,512.88

Client 71207/CROSS/TLD

User Name DIDIER, TERRIE (2267779)

Day 09/20/2016

Totals for Included 0:02:05

Totals for Day 09/20/2016 2532-71207 0:02:05

Totals for User Name DIDIER, TERRIE (2267779) 0:02:05

Totals for Client 71207/CROSS/TLD 0:02:05

Client 71207/CROSS/TLD

User Name DIDIER, TERRIE (2267779)

Day 12/01/2016

Totals for Included 0:02:18

Totals for Day 12/01/2016 2532-71207 0:02:18

Totals for User Name DIDIER, TERRIE (2267779) 0:02:18

Totals for Client 71207/CROSS/TLD 0:02:18

YWS

23.92 USD	14.35 USD	9.57 USD	9.57 USD
23.92 USD	14.35 USD	9.57 USD	9.57 USD
23.92 USD	14.35 USD	9.57 USD	9.57 USD
23.92 USD	14.35 USD	9.57 USD	9.57 USD ✓

YWS

21.41 USD	12.85 USD	8.56 USD	8.56 USD
21.41 USD	12.85 USD	8.56 USD	8.56 USD
21.41 USD	12.85 USD	8.56 USD	8.56 USD
21.41 USD	12.85 USD	8.56 USD	8.56 USD ✓

Transactions Full Cost Detail Report

matter id '2532-71207' and component yco and statement number 81832

<u>File Number</u>	<u>Client</u>	<u>Matter Description</u>	
2532-71207	City of Pensacola	Bayview Cross Litigation - Kondrat'yev v. The City of	
ALL COST			Amount
10/3/2016	yco	Copy cost 4 copies	1.00
11/8/2016	yco	Copy cost 1 copy	0.25
12/29/2016	yco	Copy cost 10 copies	2.50
1/20/2017	yco	Copy cost 11 copies	2.75
1/24/2017	yco	Copy cost 35 copies	8.75
			<hr/> 15.25